SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION

FORM 8-K

Current report filing

Filing Date: 2005-05-02 | Period of Report: 2005-04-29
SEC Accession No. 0001005229-05-000012

(HTML Version on secdatabase.com)

FILER

COLUMBUS MCKINNON CORP

CIK:1005229| IRS No.: 160547600 | State of Incorp.:NY | Fiscal Year End: 0331
Type: 8-K | Act: 34 | File No.: 000-27618 | Film No.: 05791400

SIC: 3531 Construction machinery & equip

AUDUBON EUROPES ARL

CIK:1263401| IRS No.: 421542436 | Fiscal Year End: 0331
Type: 8-K | Act: 34 | File No.: 333-109730-04 | Film No.: 05791401

CRANE EQUIPMENT & SERVICE INC

CIK:1263400| IRS No.: 731515437 | State of Incorp.:OK | Fiscal Year End: 0331
Type: 8-K | Act: 34 | File No.: 333-109730-02 | Film No.: 05791402

YALE INDUSTRIAL PRODUCTS INC

CIK:1062624| IRS No.: 710585582 | State of Incorp.:MO | Fiscal Year End: 0331
Type: 8-K | Act: 34 | File No.: 333-53759-06 | Film No.: 05791403

Mailing Address

140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON
PARKWAY

AMHERST NY 14228-1197

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document

Business Address

140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON
PKWY

AMHERST NY 14228-1197
7166895400

Business Address

140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON
PARKWAY

AMHERST NY 14428
7166895405

Business Address

140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON
PARKWAY

AMHERST NY 14428
7166895405

Business Address

140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON
PARKWAY

AMHERST NY 19228-1197
7166895400


http://www.sec.gov/Archives/edgar/data/0001005229/000100522905000012/0001005229-05-000012-index.htm
http://edgar.secdatabase.com/2947/100522905000012/filing-main.htm
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1005229
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1005229
http://www.secdatabase.com/FileNumber/27618
http://www.secdatabase.com/SIC/3531
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1263401
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1263401
http://www.secdatabase.com/FileNumber/33310973004
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1263400
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1263400
http://www.secdatabase.com/FileNumber/33310973002
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1062624
http://www.secdatabase.com/CIK/1062624
http://www.secdatabase.com/FileNumber/3335375906
http://www.secdatabase.com

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION
Washington, D.C. 20549
FORM 8-K
CURRENT REPORT

Pursuant to Section 13 or 15(d) of
the Securities Exchange Act of 1934

Date of Report (Date of earliest event reported): APRIL 29, 2005

(Exact name of registrant as specified in its charter)

NEW YORK

(State or other jurisdiction of incorporation)

0-27618 16-0547600
(Commission File Number) (IRS Employer Identification No.)
140 JOHN JAMES AUDUBON PARKWAY, AMHERST, NEW YORK 14228-1197
(Address of principal executive offices) (Zip Code)

Registrant's telephone number including area code: (716) 689-5400

(Former name or former address, if changed since last report)

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

Item 1.01. ENTRY INTO A MATERIAL DEFINITIVE AGREEMENT.

On April 29, 2005, the registrant amended its existing revolving credit
facility and term loan. The amendment increases availability under the revolving
credit facility from $50 million to $65 million and converts the term loan into
a revolving loan. A copy of the new agreement issued in connection with such
action is attached hereto as Exhibit 10.1.

Item 2.03. CREATION OF A DIRECT FINANCIAL OBLIGATION OR AN OBLIGATION UNDER
AN OFF-BALANCE SHEET ARRANGEMENT.

On April 29, 2005, the registrant amended its existing revolving credit
facility and term loan. See Item 1.01.

Item 9.01. FINANCIAL STATEMENTS AND EXHIBITS.

(c) Exhibits.

EXHIBIT NUMBER DESCRIPTION

10.1 First Amendment to that certain Second Amended and
Restated Credit and Security Agreement, dated as of
November 21, 2002 and amended and restated as of January
2, 2004, among Columbus McKinnon Corporation, as
Borrower, Larco Industrial Services Ltd., Columbus
McKinnon Limited, the Guarantors From Time to Time Party
Thereto, the Lenders From Time to Time Party Thereto,
Bank of America, N.A., as Administrative Agent for such
Lenders and as Issuing Lender dated April 29, 2005.

SIGNATURES
Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934,

the registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the
undersigned thereunto duly authorized.

COLUMBUS MCKINNON CORPORATION

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

Dated: APRIL 29, 2005

EXHIBIT NUMBER

By: /S/ ROBERT R. FRIEDL

Name: Robert R. Friedl

Title: Vice

President - Finance and Chief

Financial Officer

EXHIBIT

DESCRIPTION

First Amendment
Restated Credit

November 21, 2002
2, 2004, among

Borrower, Larco
McKinnon Limited,

INDEX

to that certain Second Amended and
and Security Agreement, dated as of
and amended and restated as of January
Columbus McKinnon Corporation, as
Industrial Services Ltd., Columbus
the Guarantors From Time to Time Party

Thereto, the Lenders From Time to Time Party Thereto,

Bank of America,

N.A., as Administrative Agent for such

Lenders and as Issuing Lender dated April 29, 2005.

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

FIRST AMENDMENT
to that certain
SECOND AMENDED AND RESTATED CREDIT AND SECURITY AGREEMENT

This FIRST AMENDMENT (this "AMENDMENT"), dated as of April 29, 2005, to
that certain Second Amended and Restated Credit and Security Agreement, dated as
of January 2, 2004 (as modified and supplemented and in effect from time to
time, the "CREDIT Agreement"), among Columbus McKinnon Corporation, a
corporation organized wunder the laws of New York (the "BORROWER"), Larco
Industrial Services Ltd., a business corporation organized under the laws of the
Province of Ontario, Columbus McKinnon Limited, a business corporation organized
under the laws of Canada, the Guarantors from time to time party thereto, the
Lenders from time to time party thereto (collectively, the "LENDERS"), Bank of
America, N.A., as Administrative Agent for such Lenders (the "AGENT") and as
Issuing Lender.

WHEREAS, the Borrower has requested that the Agent and the Lenders agree to
amend certain of the terms and provisions of the Credit Agreement, as
specifically set forth in this Amendment.

NOW, THEREFORE, 1in consideration of the foregoing, and for other good and
valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby
acknowledged, the parties hereby agree as follows:

1. DEFINITIONS. Capitalized terms used herein without definition shall have
the meanings assigned to such terms in the Credit Agreement.

2. AMENDMENTS TO DEFINITIONS. Section 1.1 of the Credit Agreement is hereby
amended as follows:

(a) The second table contained in the definition of "Applicable Margin" is
hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

<TABLE>
<CAPTION>
APPLICABLE MARGIN (% PER ANNUM)
LEVEL SENIOR LEVERAGE RATIO LIBOR RATE LOANS BASE RATE LOANS
<S> <C> <C> <C>

I =>3.00:1 2.00% 75%

II => 2.50:1 and <3.00:1 1.75% 50%

ITI => 2.00:1 and <2.50:1 1.75% 50%

v < 2.00:1 1.50% 25%
</TABLE>

(b) The definition of "Approved Restructuring Charges" is hereby deleted
and replaced with the following:

""APPROVED RESTRUCTURING CHARGES" means cash restructuring
charges incurred by the Borrower and/or its Subsidiaries and
approved by the Agent up to an amount not to exceed $750,000 in
the aggregate in any fiscal year.

(c) The definition of "Agent" is hereby deleted and replaced with the
following:

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

""AGENT" means Bank of America, N.A. in its capacity as
administrative agent for the Lenders hereunder."

(d) The definition of "Agent's Office" is hereby deleted and replaced with
the following:

""AGENT'S OFFICE" means 100 Federal Street, Boston, MA 02110."

(e) The definition of "Cash Management Bank" is hereby deleted and replaced
with the following:

""CASH MANAGEMENT BANK" means Bank of America, N.A."

(f) The definition of "Domestic Borrowing Base" 1is hereby amended by (1)
deleting the period at then end of clause (d) contained therein, (ii)
substituting in lieu thereof the text "; PLUS" and (iii) adding the following
new clause (e) at the end thereof.

"(e) the 1lesser of (i) $15,000,000 and (ii) the Term Loan
Borrowing Base, PLUS"

(g) The definition of "Domestic Borrowing Base" is hereby further amended
by deleting the second sentence contained in the 1last paragraph of such
definition and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"Notwithstanding anything to the contrary set forth herein, the
Agent may in its sole discretion at any time and from time to
time, subject to subsections 11.2(b) (xi)) and (b) (xii), adjust
the percentages of Eligible Accounts, Eligible Fixed Assets or of
Eligible Inventory, change eligibility criteria contained in the
definitions of Eligible Accounts, Eligible Fixed Assets or
Eligible Inventory, and change and/or establish reserves (such
reserves to be standard and customary for facilities of this
nature) taken in respect of Eligible Inventory, Eligible Fixed
Assets and Eligible Accounts from time to time based upon the
results of any appraisals or other sources of information which
demonstrate 1in the Agent's reasonable Jjudgment based on due
inquiry a change in the collectability of accounts receivable of
the Borrower or any Domestic Subsidiary and/or the marketability
or composition of inventory and fixed assets of the Borrower or
any Domestic Subsidiary and/or other market changes affecting the
value of accounts, inventory or fixed assets comprising the
Domestic Borrowing Base."

(h) The definition of "Eligible Accounts" is hereby amended by (i) deleting
clause (xv) contained therein, (ii) redesignating the existing clause (xvi)
contained therein as clause (xv) and (iii) redesignating the existing clause
(xvii) contained therein as clause (xvi).

(1) The definition of "Eligible Inventory" is hereby amended by deleting
clause (vi) contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"(vi) it is not accounted for in the obsolescence reserve
maintained by any Credit Party or has not been determined by the
Agent in 1its sole discretion to constitute slow-moving

inventory;"
(j) The definition of "Extraordinary Receipts" 1s hereby amended by
deleting clause (a) contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof " (a)

INTENTIONALLY OMITTED, ".

(k) The definition of "Fee Letter" is hereby deleted and replaced with the
following:

""FEE LETTER" means that certain Fee Letter, dated November 27,
2002, between the Borrower and Bank of America, N.A., as assignee
of Fleet Capital Corporation.

(1) The definition of "Fixed Charge Coverage Ratio" is hereby amended by
deleting clause (b) (1) contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

" (i) the aggregate amount of Interest Expense for such Reference
Period (net of amortization during such Reference Period of
financing costs incurred in connection with this Agreement, the
Existing Credit Agreement, the Senior Subordinated Note Indenture
and the Senior Note Indenture) and"

(m) The definition of "Issuing Lender" is hereby deleted and replaced with
the following:

""ISSUING LENDER" means (a) Bank of America, N.A. and (b) solely
in connection with Letters of Credit outstanding on the First
Amendment Effective Date, Fleet National Bank."

(n) The definition of "LIBOR Rate" is deleted and replaced with the
following:

"LIBOR RATE" means, for any Interest Period with respect to a
LIBOR Rate Loan, the rate per annum equal to the British Bankers
Association LIBOR Rate ("BBA LIBOR"), as published by Reuters (or
other commercially available source providing quotations of BBA
LIBOR as designated by the Agent from time to time) at
approximately 11:00 a.m., London time, two Business Days prior to
the commencement of such Interest Period, for Dollar deposits
(for delivery on the first day of such Interest Period) with a
term equivalent to such Interest Period divided by a number equal
to 1.00 minus the Eurocurrency Reserve Rate. If such rate is not
available at such time for any reason, then the "LIBOR Rate" for
such Interest Period shall be the rate per annum determined by
the Agent to be the rate at which deposits in Dollars for
delivery on the first day of such Interest Period in same day
funds in the approximate amount of the LIBOR Rate Loan being
made, continued or converted by Bank of America and with a term
equivalent to such Interest Period would be offered by Bank of
America 's London Branch to major banks in the London interbank
eurodollar market at their request at approximately 11:00 a.m.
(London time) two Business Days prior to the commencement of such
Interest Period.

(0) The definition of "Revolving Credit Notes" is hereby amended be
deleting the period contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the
following:

", as such promissory notes may be amended and restated from time
to time."

(p) The definition of "Senior Subordinated Note Documents" 1is hereby
amended by deleting the period contained therein and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:

"; PROVIDED that, after the repayment in full of the Existing
Senior Subordinated Notes and the issuance of the Additional
Senior Subordinated Notes, "Senior Subordinated Note Documents"
shall mean the Additional Senior Subordinated Note Documents."

(q) The definition of "Senior Subordinated Note Indenture" 1is hereby
amended by deleting the period contained therein and substituting in lieu
thereof the following:

"; PROVIDED that, after the repayment in full of the Existing
Senior Subordinated Notes and the issuance of the Additional
Senior Subordinated Notes, "Senior Subordinated Note Indenture"
shall mean the Additional Senior Subordinated Note Indenture."

(r) The definition of "Senior Subordinated Notes" is hereby deleted and
replaced with the following:

""SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTES" means the Existing Senior
Subordinated Notes; PROVIDED that, after the repayment in full of
the Existing Senior Subordinated Notes and the issuance of the
Additional Senior Subordinated Notes, "Senior Subordinated Notes"
shall mean the Additional Senior Subordinated Notes.

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

(s) The definition of "Special Counsel" is hereby amended by deleting the
reference to "Fleet Capital Corporation" contained therein and substituting in
lieu thereof a reference to "Bank of America, N.A.".

(t) The definition of "Total Revolving Credit Commitment" is hereby amended
by adding the following sentence at the end of such definition:

"On the First Amendment Effective Date, the Total Revolving
Credit Commitment is $65,000,000."

(u) The following definitions are hereby added to Section 1.1 of the Credit
Agreement and inserted in correct alphabetical order:

""ADDITIONAL SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTES" means the Borrower's
senior subordinated notes to be issued pursuant to the Additional
Senior Subordinated Indenture, on terms and conditions
(including, without limitation, subordination provisions)
satisfactory to the Agent, as the same shall, subject to the
terms and conditions of this Agreement, be amended, supplemented
or otherwise modified and in effect from time to time.

"ADDITIONAL SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTE DOCUMENTS" means the
Additional Senior Subordinated Note Indenture, the Additional
Senior Subordinated Notes and all other documents, instruments
and agreements executed and delivered in connection with the
Additional Senior Subordinated Notes, in each case, in form and
substance satisfactory to the Agent, as the same shall, subject
to the terms and conditions of this Agreement, Dbe amended,
supplemented or otherwise modified and in effect from time to
time.

"ADDITIONAL SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTE INDENTURE" means the
Indenture relating to the Additional Senior Subordinated Notes,
in form and substance satisfactory to the Agent, as the same
shall, subject to the terms and conditions of this Agreement, be
amended from time to time.

"ADDITIONAL SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTES" means the Borrower's
senior subordinated notes to be issued pursuant to the Additional
Senior Subordinated Indenture, on terms and conditions
(including, without limitation, subordination provisions)
satisfactory to the Agent, as the same shall, subject to the
terms and conditions of this Agreement, be amended, supplemented
or otherwise modified and in effect from time to time.

"EXISTING SENIOR SUBORDINATED NOTES" means the Borrower's 8-1/2%
senior subordinated notes due 2008 issued pursuant to the Senior
Subordinated Note Indenture, as the same shall, subject to the
terms and conditions of this Agreement, be amended, supplemented
or otherwise modified and in effect from time to time.

"FIRST AMENDMENT EFFECTIVE DATE" means April 29, 2005.

"OPERATING LEASES" means leases under which any Credit Party or
any of its Subsidiaries is the lessee or the obligor, other than
capital leases."

3. AMENDMENT TO TERM LOAN. Section 2.2 of the Credit Agreement is hereby
amended by adding the following new clause (f) immediately following clause (e)
contained therein:

"(f) On the First Amendment Effective Date, (i) the aggregate
outstanding principal amount of the Term Loans (equivalent to
$5,321,428.60) shall be converted 1into an equivalent amount of
Revolving Loans, owing to each of the Lenders in accordance with
their respective Commitment Percentages and (ii) the Borrower
shall pay to the Agent for the PRO RATA accounts of the Lenders
all interest accrued to such date on the Term Loans."

4. AMENDMENTS TO DOMESTIC LETTERS OF CREDIT AND FOREIGN LETTERS OF CREDIT.

(a) Section 2.4 (a) (i) (a) of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by
deleting the amount "$12,000,000"™ contained therein and substituting in lieu

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

thereof the amount "$20,000,000".

(b) Section 2.4 (a) (ii) (a) of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by
deleting the amount "$5,000,000" contained therein and substituting in lieu
thereof the amount "$10,000,000".

(c) Section 2.4(b) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by (i)
deleting the amount "$12,000,000" contained therein and substituting in lieu
thereof the amount "$20,000,000" and (ii) deleting the amount "$5,000,000"
contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the amount "$10,000,000".

5. AMENDMENTS TO PAYMENTS GENERALLY; PRO RATA TREATMENT; SHARING OF
SET-OFFS; COLLECTION.

(a) Section 2.7 (b) (iv) of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by
deleting the amount "$5,000,000" contained therein and substituting in lieu
thereof the amount "$10,000,000".

(b) Section 2.7(g) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the reference to "2.7(d)" contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof a
reference to "2.7(e)".

(c) Section 2.7 of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by adding the
following new clause (h) immediately following clause (g) contained therein:

" (h) SUSPENSION OF SECTIONS 2.7(C) AND (D). Commencing on the
First Amendment Effective Date, the provisions contained in
Sections 2.7(c) and (d) shall be inoperative until the Agent, in
its sole discretion and upon notice to the Borrower, reinstates
such provisions."

6. AMENDMENT TO PREPAYMENT OF LOANS.

(a) Section 2.8 (a) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by adding the
following immediately after the first sentence contained therein:

"Each such prepayment shall be accompanied by the payment of
accrued interest on the principal prepaid to the date of
prepayment and shall be applied, in the absence of instruction by
the Borrower, first to the principal of Base Rate Loans and then
to the principal of LIBOR Rate Loans. Each partial prepayment
shall be allocated among the Lenders, in proportion, as nearly as
practicable, to the respective wunpaid principal amount of each
Lender's Revolving Credit Note, with adjustments to the extent
practicable to equalize any prior repayments not exactly in
proportion."

(b) Section 2.8(c) (ii) of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by
deleting the text "and corresponding increase in the Domestic Prepayment
Reserve" contained therein and adding a period after the word "Commitments".

7. AMENDMENT TO FEES.

(a) Section 2.9(b) (x) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the text "one-half of one percent (1/2%)" contained therein and substituting in
lieu thereof the text "the Applicable Margin then in effect and applicable to
the column "Unused Fees" set forth in the definition of "Applicable Margin""

(b) Section 2.9(c) (iii) of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by
deleting the proviso contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the text
"PROVIDED that any such fees accruing after the date on which the Revolving

Credit Commitment terminates shall be payable on demand and any fronting fee
with respect to documentary Letters of Credit shall be payable upon the issuance
of such documentary Letter of Credit.

8. AMENDMENT TO CHANGE IN DOMESTIC BORROWING BASE, CANADIAN BORROWING BASE
AND TERM LOAN BORROWING BASE. Section 2.13 of the Credit Agreement is hereby
amended by deleting the first sentence contained therein and substituting in
lieu thereof the following sentence:

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

"The Domestic Borrowing Base and the Canadian Borrowing Base
shall be determined monthly (or at such other interval as may be
specified pursuant to subsection 7.1) by the Agent by reference
to the Borrowing Base Certificate, commercial finance and
collateral audit reports, the Collateral Update Certificate,
Accounts Receivable/Loan Reconciliation Report and/or appraisals
or reappraisals of Eligible Fixed Assets delivered to the Lenders
and the Agent pursuant to subsection 7.1 together with other
information obtained by or provided to the Agent."

9. AMENDMENT TO COLLECTION OF PROCEEDS OF ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE. Section
4.3(a) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by adding the following new
sentence at the end of such Section 4.3 (a):

"Notwithstanding the foregoing, (a) commencing on the First
Amendment Effective Date, the provisions contained in clause
(iii) (B) above shall be inoperative wuntil the Agent, in its sole
discretion and upon notice to the Borrower, reinstates such
provisions and (b) until the Agent reinstates such provisions,
all amounts in such accounts shall be transferred to the
Borrower's operating account maintained with the Cash Management
Bank."

10. AMENDMENTS TO AFFIRMATIVE COVENANTS.

(a) Section 7.1(f) of the Credit Agreement is hereby further amended by
adding the following text at the end of such Section 7.1 (f):

"PROVIDED that, the Borrower shall only be required to deliver
such Borrowing Base Certificate pursuant to this clause (f) in
the event that (i) Domestic Excess Availability, as evidenced by
the most recent Borrowing Base Certificate delivered pursuant to
Section 7.1(g), is less than $12,000,0000 or (ii) Domestic Excess
Availability is less than $15,000,000 but not 1less than
$12,000,000, as evidenced Dby the most recent Borrowing Base
Certificate delivered pursuant to Section 7.1(g), and the
Domestic Excess Availability has not, as evidenced by an updated
Borrowing Base Certificate, Dbeen increased to an amount equal to
or greater than $15,000,000 within ten (10) days of delivery of
such original Borrowing Base Certificate; PROVIDED further that,
in the event that the Domestic Excess Availability, as evidenced
by the Borrowing Base Certificates delivered pursuant to Section
7.1(g) for any three consecutive months following the occurrence
of an event described in clause (i) or (ii) above, is at or above
$15,000, 000, such requirement to deliver a Borrowing Base
Certificate pursuant to this clause (f) shall terminate (it being
understood that such requirement to deliver a Borrowing Base
Certificate pursuant to this clause (f) shall be reinstated in

the event that the circumstances described in clause (i) or (ii)
are repeated) ;"

(b) Section 7.1(g) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
clause (i) contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"(i) a Borrowing Base Certificate in the form attached hereto as
EXHIBIT B-1 setting forth the Domestic Borrowing Base and
Canadian Borrowing Base, together with an wupdated 1list of
Eligible Fixed Assets as of such month ended and a list of all
Hedging Agreements entered into by any Credit Party during such
month, "

(c) Section 7.1(j) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the text contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"INTENTIONALLY OMITTED."

(d) Section 7.6 of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting the
first PROVISO contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"PROVIDED that, so long as no Default has occurred and is
continuing, (x) all such wvisits shall be on reasonable prior
notice, at reasonable times during regular business hours and (y)

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

the Agent shall not conduct commercial finance examinations more
than once in any 365 day period; PROVIDED that, the Agent shall
have the right to conduct commercial finance examinations once in
any 180 day period while the Credit Parties are required to
deliver a Borrowing Base Certificate pursuant to Section 7.1 (f);
and PROVIDED further that after the occurrence and during the
continuance of any Default, the Agent and the Lenders may visit
at any reasonable times."

(e) Section 7.9 of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by adding the
following text immediately following the text "Existing Indebtedness":

", a portion of the Senior Subordinated Notes (solely to the
extent permitted pursuant to Section 8.6(e))"

11. AMENDMENT TO NEGATIVE COVENANTS.

(a) Section 8.1 of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting the
word "and" at the end of clause (e) and adding the following new clauses
immediately following clause (f):

"(g) Indebtedness of any Credit Party or any Subsidiary of a
Credit Party wunder any Operating Lease; PROVIDED that the
aggregate amount of such Indebtedness of the Credit Parties and
their Subsidiaries shall not exceed $6,000,000 annually; and

(h) Indebtedness of the Borrower 1in the aggregate principal
amount not to exceed $125,000,000, evidenced or incurred under
the Additional Senior Subordinated Note Documents; PROVIDED that
(i) all principal and interest of the Existing Senior
Subordinated Notes shall be contemporaneously repaid in full and
(ii) such Indebtedness 1is designated as "Senior Indebtedness"
under the Additional Senior Subordinated Note Indenture."

(b) Section 8.5 of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by deleting
clause (b) contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"(b) The Credit Parties will not, and will not permit any of
their Subsidiaries to, enter into any Hedging Agreement, other
than Hedging Agreements entered into in the ordinary course of
business on a non-speculative basis to hedge or mitigate risks to
which the Credit Parties are exposed 1in the conduct of their
business or the management of their liabilities."

(c) Section 8.6 of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by adding the
following new clause (e):

"(e) (i) ©prepayments of principal of the Senior Subordinated
Notes so 1long as (A) no Default shall have occurred or be
continuing and no Default shall be caused thereby, (B) the Credit
Parties shall be in compliance with each of the financial
covenants set forth 1in Section 8.10 for the most recent
applicable period ended prior to such payment, (C) the Fixed
Charge Coverage Ratio for the period of two (2) quarters ending
prior to such payment, calculated on a pro forma basis giving
effect to the making of such payment of principal (as if such
payment were made on the first day of such period and including
the amount of such payment in clause (b) (ii) of the definition of
"Fixed Charge Coverage Ratio" in the calculation of Fixed Charge
Coverage Ratio as if they were scheduled or required payments)
shall not be less than 1.25:1.00, and the Credit Parties shall
deliver a Compliance Certificate prior to such payment
demonstrating such Fixed Charge Coverage Ratio, (D) Domestic
Excess Availability, calculated on a pro forma basis after giving
effect to such payment shall not be less than $15,000,000, and
the Agent shall have received a Borrowing Base Certificate
demonstrating the same, (E) the number of days of average
outstandings for the Borrower's accounts payable over the three
(3) month period prior to such payment shall not exceed thirty
five (35), (F) the Agent shall have received evidence that the
Credit Parties have obtained all necessary consents from the
holders of the Senior Notes with respect to such payment and
shall have received a legal opinion, covering such matters

Copyright © 2012 www.secdatabase.com. All Rights Reserved.
Please Consider the Environment Before Printing This Document


http://www.secdatabase.com

relating to such payment as the Agent shall reasonably request,
(G) the Credit Parties shall have <closed a tender offer with
respect to all Existing Senior Subordinated Notes that remain
outstanding after giving effect to such payment, and (H) the
aggregate amount of such payments shall not be greater than
$155,000,000 (provided that the aggregate amount of the
prepayments of the Existing Senior Subordinated Notes shall not
exceed $145,000,000); and PROVIDED that not more than $30,000,000
of such payments may be funded with the proceeds of Revolving
Credit Loans; or (ii) prepayments of principal of the Existing
Senior Subordinated Notes so long as the conditions set forth in
(i) (A)-(F) are satisfied and the aggregate amount of such
payments shall not be greater than $30,000,000; and PROVIDED that
not more than $30,000,000 of such payments may be funded with the
proceeds of Revolving Credit Loans."

(d) Section 8.10(a) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the text contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"INTENTIONALLY OMITTED."

(e) Section 8.10(b) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the table contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

June 30, 2004 and each fiscal quarter 4.25 to 1.00
ending thereafter

(f) Section 8.10(d) of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting
the text contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"INTENTIONALLY OMITTED."

(g) Section 8.15 of the Credit Agreement is hereby amended by deleting the
text contained therein and substituting in lieu thereof the following:

"INTENTIONALLY OMITTED."

12. AMENDMENT TO EVENTS OF DEFAULT. Section 9.1 (p) of the Credit Agreement
is hereby amended by deleting the text contained therein and substituting in
lieu thereof the following:

"INTENTIONALLY OMITTED."
13. NEW AGENT.

(a) Article 10 of the Credit Agreement 1is hereby amended by adding the
following new section immediately following Section 10.11:

"10.12. ASSIGNMENT TO BANK OF AMERICA. Effective on the First
Amendment Effective Date, (a) Fleet hereby resigns as Agent and
Fleet National Bank hereby resigns as Issuing Lender (except with
respect to the Letters of Credit outstanding on such date) and
Cash Management Bank (b) the Required Lenders hereby appoint Bank

of America, N.A. as Agent, Issuing Lender and Cash Management
Bank and (c) Fleet and Fleet National bank hereby assigns to, and
Bank of America, N.A. hereby assumes, all of the rights

(including, without limitation, all liens and security interests
granted to Fleet in its capacity as Agent) and obligations of
Fleet as Agent and Fleet National Bank as Issuing Lender and Cash
Management Bank. The Credit Parties agree to continue to maintain
all current accounts with Fleet National Bank with Fleet National
Bank and Fleet National Bank